
Pointing at 
Jesus
Being a Witness

John 1:19-28



“But you will receive power when 
the Holy Spirit comes on you; and 
you will be my witnesses in 
Jerusalem, and in all Judea and 
Samaria, and to the ends of the 
earth.”  

Acts 1:8



Pointing at Jesus
As witnesses we cooperate with the 

Spirit.



Jesus did many other miraculous 
signs in the presence of his 
disciples, which are not recorded in 
this book. 31 But these are written 
that you may believe that Jesus is 
the Christ, the Son of God, and that 
by believing you may have life in his 
name.  John 20:30-31



Pointing at Jesus
As witnesses we cooperate with the 

Spirit.

As a witness, share what you know.

As witnesses we point at Jesus.



“See, I will send you the prophet 
Elijah before that great and dreadful 
day of the LORD comes. 6 He will 
turn the hearts of the fathers to their 
children, and the hearts of the 
children to their fathers; or else I will 
come and strike the land with a 
curse.”  Malachi 4:5-6



And if you are willing to accept it, he 
is the Elijah who was to come.  

Matthew 11:14



Pointing at Jesus
As witnesses we cooperate with the 

Spirit.

As a witness, share what you know.

As witnesses we point at Jesus.

We may be surprised how close Jesus 
is to people.



Pointing at Jesus
A witness needs two qualities:

A personal experience.

The commitment to talk about it.
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